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This Resolution was approved by members of the Russian National Committee on Non-
Ionizing Radiation Protection (RNCNIRP) at its Committee session on 3 March 2011. The 
Resolution evolved from scientific statements adopted by RNCNIRP in 2001, 2004, 2007, 
2008 and 2009, taking into account contemporary views and actual scientific data. The 
Resolution represents a viewpoint of the professional scientific community and is meant for 
public dissemination, for the consumers of the mobile telecommunications services, as 
well as for the legislative and executive authorities who develop and implement health 
protection, environmental, communication, scientific and safety policies.  
 
Resolution: 
ELECTROMAGNETIC FIELDS FROM MOBILE PHONES: HEALTH EFFECT ON 
CHILDREN AND TEENAGERS 
 
The world-wide dissemination of mobile telecommunications has resulted in new sources 
of large-scale population exposure to radio-frequency (RF) electromagnetic fields (EMF) 
since 2000. At present, mobile phones dominate among the mobile communication 
services used by the population. By the end of 2010, there were 219.3 million mobile 
phone SIM cards registered in Rus- sian network operators [1]. The mobile phone 
penetration rate (expressed as the num- ber of SIM cards registered per 100 people) has 
reached to about 150% in Russia, and exceeded 200% in the Moscow Region. According 
to ROSSTAT (Federal State Statis- tics Service of Russian Federation), there were about 
15 million children and teenagers (ages from 5 to 19) living in Russia at the end of 2010 
[2]. They all are presumed to be a target group for marketing for telecommunication 
service providers, mobile phone vendors and others. Prevention childhood and juvenile 
diseases from exposure to EMF sources is of paramount social and economic importance. 
It is one of the bases for public health policy for the nation in the near and long-term future. 
This problem has been already recognized by the international community: in May 2011, 
the World Health Organization (WHO) will be organizing the Second International 
Conference: “Non-ionizing Radiation and Children’s Health” dedicated to health protection 
of children exposed to EMF sources of various frequency ranges. It is WHO’s opinion that 
a “child is more vulner- able to environmental factors” [3]. WHO considers that studies 
aimed at determining if there are risks to children’s health from exposure to EMF is a top 
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priority. 
 
Read the whole RESOLUTION 
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